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Providence Place Senior Living 
FOCUS ON HEALTHY AGING

Providence Place Senior Living, a family-
owned company, opened their newest loca-
tion in August at the historic Collegeville Inn.
This senior living community is pet-friendly
and offers independent living, assisted liv-
ing, along with two levels of memory sup-
port programs. Featuring a beautiful setting
on 20 acres overlooking the Perkiomen
Creek, Providence Place Senior Living of
Collegeville offers the chance to live in one
of the area’s most beloved landmarks. 

A tour of the facility can showcase the
home-like amenities and convenience the
community offers.  Residents enjoy three
chef-prepared meals per day in a restaurant-
style setting, as well as daily activities and
regular off-campus outings. Transportation
is available to residents and is included in
the monthly fee. Residents can stay active
and enjoy the scenic walking path along the
creek daily.

The property, located at 4000 Ridge Pike,
is open and welcoming new residents into
the brand-new apartments. Floor plans
range from studio to 1 bedroom for your
specific needs. Tours are available by ap-
pointment. 

For more 
information, contact 

the main office at
610.222.5007, 

or visit the 
Providence Place 

website at 
Providence-Place.com.


