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CarePatrol 
Your Partner in Senior Care Solutions 

By Kirk Campfield; 
Certified Senior Advisor (CSA)

When a health change or the aging
process raises concerns about the safety of
a loved one living in their home,
CarePatrol is here to give you peace of
mind. For over 30 years, CarePatrol’s
Senior Care Advisors have matched
seniors to pre-screened communities;
including assisted living, independent
living, personal care, memory care and in-
home care options. All of the CarePatrol
services are available at no cost to seniors
and their families.

As a pioneer in senior care advisory
services, CarePatrol is the nation’s largest
and most trusted organization in senior
care. Founded by a medical social worker
who observed the trauma of a family
whose loved one moved into the wrong
type of community, CarePatrol has grown
to over 170 locations across the country
with more than 20,000 vetted communi-
ties. By discovering more about a senior’s
needs, desires and budget, CarePatrol
provides the top communities for consid-
eration. CarePatrol accompanies the
family on tours and is proud to be their
care partner; making an overwhelming
process much more manageable.
CarePatrol makes move-in day less stress-
ful and stays in contact with the family as
a true partner in care.

My CarePatrol journey began while
caring for my mother in my home. I had
cared for her for 11 years when she fell
and broke her back on my kitchen floor. I
was just outside of my house doing yard
work and she laid there for 3.5 hours. She
wasn’t wearing her key fob and had she
not been living with me; may not have
been discovered until it was too late. This
event terrified my mother and she asked
that we look into a care community for
her. At the same time that this was
happening with my mom, my girlfriend’s
parents were also both declining and in
need of a care community. We made the
mistake of contacting certain online
agencies and were bombarded with lists
and inappropriate care options for our
loved ones. I knew there had to be a better
way. After our parents were eventually
placed in care communities, I discovered
CarePatrol as an ownership option during
the pandemic. I realized that CarePatrol
offered a much better way to go through
the trauma and uncertainty of this process
alone. I purchased my franchise in
September 2021. I wanted to help families
and their loved ones through this transi-
tion and ensure they have a better experi-
ence than myself & my girlfriend did.

Kirk Campfield can be reached at
610.777.1180 (office); 610.607.7006 (cell); or
email kcampfield@carepatrol.com, and
visit www.carepatrol.com.


