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Embody’s Sunoco Service Center
Embody’s Sunoco Service Center, lo-

cated at 1435 East High Street in Pottstown,
has been serving the surrounding area for
more than 49 years. The business is a fam-
ily-owned and operated establishment.
Owner Terry R. Embody oversees the nine
employees. All makes and models of vehi-
cles are serviced by expert technicians,
under the management of John Ray.

Embody’s is the only 100 percent serv-
ice center in the Pottstown area providing
old-fashioned service, which includes
washing windshields, checking fluids
under the hood, and checking air in tires.
Offering road services for flat tires and no
starts, the service center also performs a
complete safety check at no additional cost
with every oil and filter change.

Other services offered by Embody’s 
include: Pick up and delivery of vehicle;

PA State safety and emissions inspection;
factory-scheduled maintenance; sales and
service of many major brands of tires;
computerized wheel balancing; brake
service; exhaust repair and replacement;
air conditioning and cooling system main-
tenance and repair; tune-ups and comput-
erized engine diagnostics; fuel injection
service; engine repair; transmission service
such as fluid flushing and filter changes;
steering and suspension repairs; replace-
ment of shocks & struts; and road services.

Hours are Monday through Friday 
6 a.m. to 9 p.m., Saturday and Sunday 
7 a.m. to 7 p.m. All major credit cards are
accepted. Call 610.326.2250 any time you
need car repairs. Embody plans to stay in
business as long as possible and has no
plans to sell or retire.


