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SMALL BUSINESSES
NEED A 

VIRTUAL TOUR
By Freddy Vasquez, FXV Digital Design

Virtual tours are a tool that can help generate more traffic
for your website and business. 

Technology has enhanced virtually everything we use
daily (see what we did there?). Be ahead of your competi-

tion with virtual touring or create a virtual tour for your business as a flex. 
Virtual reality is of interest to the public.

Oblige their curiosity while gaining
viewers and customers by creating a
virtual tour. It may sound niche or
expensive, but it can help influence a new
demographic to see what your company
is all about. People are drawn to virtual
tours. This will allow people to discover
your small business, engage with the
virtual tour, and discover what your
services are. Customers are literally
visiting your storefront. Seal the deal! 

You might be asking, “What is a virtual
tour?” A virtual tour is a simulation of a
physical area taken with 360-degree
photographs. Once the end product is

ready to be shown, add it to your business’
Google My Business page, so viewers and
consumers can visit your store from the
comfort of their homes. Still not
convinced? Let’s talk about what virtual
touring can do for your business. 

Content Creates Engagement 
FXV Digital Design loves search 

engine optimization. Virtual reality is
unique and fresh. This content has been
added into Google’s algorithm to 
increase search rank for websites. This
comes from websites like Facebook 
pouring resources into virtual reality. 

(Continued on page 58)
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High quality content earns businesses a
higher rank on search engines. We reiter-
ate, being on the first page of search en-
gines is an advantage for your business.
Increasing the number of high-quality
posts, photos, videos, reviews and virtual
tours increases the odds of search engine
selection. 

Think of it like this: A potential
customer comes across your website and
sees a virtual tour page. This virtual tour
allows customers to see what your
business is all about. Virtual reality may
seem like a feature that elevates your
website and company compared to your
competition. Seeing content like virtual
reality appears “next-level.” 

Attract Customers 
Virtual Reality is unique. Everyone

wants to experience it. Have the photos
done by a trusted photographer. The
initial cost is inexpensive, and the
exposure may triple the return on
investment. Take our company, when we
added our Virtual Touring segment, we
saw an increase of 700 views on our
website. Viewers and customers want to
know what a business is about. Viewers
don’t need fancy tools to view virtual
touring, just a smartphone or a desktop.
This content separates your business from
the plebs. 

Views from the Web
FXV Digital Design saw an increase in

traffic to our website. We knew this

thanks to Google My Business. Google
My Business is a free tool to link your
business’ information like website,
business hours, and reviews. When your
Google My Business account is created,
you can keep tabs on the virtual tour
views. On top of that feature, you can
check the initial impressions from users,
how many users clicked from their
browser to your webpage, and other
features that will show an increase of
traffic created. 

The Virtual Tour 
is Everlasting

It’s a one-time deal, unless you move
buildings or totally revamp your
storefront. The initial cost of photos, and
to add it your Google My Business, then
you sit back and watch the traffic rise.
Google will host your virtual tour
indefinitely until you want it gone. Sit
back and watch your numbers rise! 

Do you want to increase online
presence and traffic? Then you must
heavily consider virtual touring. The
outcome is only positive: more online
traffic, a higher rank on search engines,
and a cool way to demonstrate your
business for a few initial costs. 

Still unsure about virtual tours? FXV
Digital Design is here to help your
business stand out from your
competitors. Give us a call today at
484.509.4285 or visit us online at
www.fxvdigital.com.
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PROMOTE YOUR BUSINESS! 
CALL (610) 323- 6253 


